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PERSPECTIVE 
Osteopathic medicine: A holistic approach to healthcare 

Amelia Johnson 

INTRODUCTION 

steopathic medicine, though often overshadowed by its 
allopathic counterpart, represents a vital component of the 

medical field. Founded by Dr. Andrew Taylor Still in 1874, 
osteopathic medicine arose from a dissatisfaction with the medical 
practices of the time, which often relied on treatments that were 
harmful or ineffective. Dr. Still's revolutionary idea was to view the 
body as an integrated whole, promoting health by focusing on the 
musculoskeletal system and its relationship to other bodily systems. 

Osteopathic physicians, or DOs, receive comprehensive training in all 
aspects of modern medicine, including surgery, pharmacology, and 
diagnostics, but also learn unique techniques in Osteopathic 
Manipulative Treatment (OMT). This approach allows DOs to use 
their hands to diagnose, treat, and prevent illness or injury. By 
addressing structural imbalances, osteopathic physicians aim to 
enhance the body's natural ability to heal itself. 
The roots of osteopathic medicine can be traced back to the late 19th 
century when Dr. Andrew Taylor Still, a physician and surgeon, 
sought better methods of treating patients. Disillusioned with the 
conventional medical practices of his time, which he found to be 
often ineffective and sometimes dangerous, Dr. Still developed a new 
approach based on the principles that the body is a unified whole, 
and that it possesses innate mechanisms for self-regulation and 
healing. 
Dr. Still established the first school of osteopathy in Kirksville, 

Missouri, in 1892. His philosophy was grounded in the belief that 
health is not merely the absence of disease but a state of harmony and 
balance within the body. He emphasized the importance of the 
musculoskeletal system in maintaining overall health, arguing that 
structural problems in the spine and other parts of the body could 
disrupt the functioning of internal organs and impede the body's 
ability to heal. 
The body is a unit: Osteopathic medicine views the body as an 
integrated whole, where all systems are interconnected and 
interdependent. This holistic perspective ensures that DOs consider 
the impact of a problem in one area on the entire body. 

Structure and function are interrelated: Osteopathic medicine 
emphasizes the relationship between the body's structure and its 
function. An issue in the musculoskeletal system, such as a 
misaligned spine, can affect the function of internal organs and 
overall health. 

The body possesses self-regulatory mechanisms: The body has 
inherent mechanisms for maintaining health and healing itself. 
Osteopathic medicine aims to support and enhance these natural 
processes rather than merely treating symptoms. 

Rational treatment is based on understanding of these principles: 
Effective treatment in osteopathic medicine is grounded in a 
thorough understanding of the body's unity, the interrelationship of 
structure and function, and its self-regulatory capabilities. 
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ABSTRACT 
Osteopathic medicine is a distinctive branch of medical practice in the 

United States, emphasizing a holistic approach to patient care. 

Originating in the late 19th century, osteopathic medicine integrates 

conventional medical practices with Osteopathic Manipulative 

Treatment (OMT), a set of techniques aimed at improving the body's 

natural healing processes. This article explores the history, principles, 

and practices of osteopathic medicine, highlighting its unique 

contributions to healthcare. By focusing on the interrelationship of the 

body's systems, osteopathic physicians (DOs) provide comprehensive 

care that addresses the physical, emotional, and psychological aspects 

of health. The conclusion underscores the importance of osteopathic 

medicine in contemporary healthcare and its potential for future 

advancements. 
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One of the defining features of osteopathic medicine is Osteopathic 
Manipulative Treatment (OMT). This set of hands-on techniques is 
used by DOs to diagnose, treat, and prevent illness or injury. OMT 
involves the application of manual pressure or force to the body's 
tissues, including muscles, bones, and joints, to improve mobility, 
relieve pain, and support the body's natural healing processes. 

OMT can be used to treat a wide range of conditions, from 
musculoskeletal pain and injuries to respiratory issues and digestive 
problems. Some common OMT techniques include: 

Soft tissue techniques: These involve rhythmic stretching, deep 
pressure, and traction to release muscle tension and improve blood 
flow. 

High-Velocity, Low-Amplitude (HVLA) thrusts: These quick, precise 
movements are used to restore joint mobility and alignment. 

Muscle energy techniques: These involve the patient actively 
contracting their muscles against a counterforce applied by the 
physician to improve joint function and range of motion. 

Myofascial release: This technique involves applying gentle, sustained 
pressure to the connective tissues to release restrictions and improve 
movement. 

OMT is particularly effective in addressing conditions such as back 
pain, neck pain, sports injuries, and chronic pain syndromes. By 
improving structural alignment and enhancing circulation, OMT can 
also support overall health and well-being. 

Osteopathic physicians, or DOs, are fully licensed to practice 
medicine and surgery in all 50 states and have the same rights and 
responsibilities as their allopathic counterparts, MDs. They undergo 
rigorous medical training, which includes four years of medical 
school followed by residency programs that can last three to seven 
years, depending on the specialty. 

One of the distinguishing features of DOs is their holistic approach 
to patient care. They are trained to consider the whole person, 
including lifestyle factors, emotional well-being, and social context, in 
their diagnosis and treatment plans. This patient-centered approach is 
particularly valuable in primary care, where DOs often serve as family 
physicians, internists, and pediatricians. 

DOs are also increasingly represented in various medical specialties, 
including surgery, emergency medicine, and obstetrics and 
gynecology. Their training in OMT provides them with additional 
tools to address a wide range of conditions and support the body's 
natural healing processes. 

Osteopathic medicine's holistic approach is evident in the day-to-day 
practice of DOs. They take time to listen to their patients, understand 
their concerns, and develop personalized treatment plans that address 
the root causes of health issues rather than just the symptoms. 

For example, a patient with chronic headaches might receive a 
comprehensive evaluation that includes a review of their posture, 

muscle tension, and lifestyle factors such as stress and diet. In 
addition to conventional treatments like medication, the DO might 
use OMT techniques to release tension in the neck and shoulders, 
provide dietary and lifestyle recommendations, and offer stress 
management strategies. 

This integrative approach not only alleviates the immediate symptoms 
but also promotes long-term health and well-being by addressing the 
underlying factors contributing to the patient's condition. 

As healthcare continues to evolve, the principles and practices of 
osteopathic medicine are increasingly recognized for their value in 
promoting holistic, patient-centered care. The growing emphasis on 
preventive medicine, chronic disease management, and integrated 
care aligns well with the osteopathic philosophy. 

Research on the effectiveness of OMT and other osteopathic practices 
is expanding, providing evidence for their benefits in various clinical 
settings. Studies have shown that OMT can be effective in reducing 
pain, improving function, and enhancing the quality of life for 
patients with conditions such as low back pain, migraine headaches, 
and respiratory infections. 

In addition, the osteopathic profession is committed to advancing 
medical education and training. Osteopathic medical schools 
continue to grow, producing a new generation of physicians who are 
equipped with both the technical skills of modern medicine and the 
holistic perspective of osteopathic principles. 

CONCLUSIONS 

Osteopathic medicine, with its emphasis on the interrelationship of 
the body's systems and its focus on holistic patient care, represents a 
unique and valuable approach to healthcare. By integrating 
conventional medical practices with osteopathic manipulative 
treatment, DOs provide comprehensive care that addresses the 
physical, emotional, and psychological aspects of health. 

The principles of osteopathic medicine—viewing the body as a unit, 
recognizing the interrelationship of structure and function, and 
supporting the body's self-regulatory mechanisms—are increasingly 
relevant in today's healthcare landscape. As the demand for patient-
centered, integrative care continues to grow, osteopathic medicine is 
well-positioned to make significant contributions to the health and 
well-being of individuals and communities. 

In conclusion, the holistic approach of osteopathic medicine, coupled 
with its emphasis on preventive care and patient-centered practices, 
ensures that it remains a vital and dynamic part of the medical field. 
With ongoing research and advancements in medical education, the 
future of osteopathic medicine looks promising, offering innovative 
solutions and compassionate care for patients worldwide.  


